
 
      The Schedule Does Not Become Active Until 6pm Tuesday      

***All Programming Can Be Found on Our YouTube Channel*** 

 
TIME TITLE DESCRIPTION 

6:00AM TV20 NEWS 

1. Pan American Masters Games - The 
Pan American Masters Games were 
recently held in the City of Cleveland, 
bringing in thousands of spectators 
and athletes from over 80 countries 
and 48 states…And Cleveland was 
ready for them!  

2. Hoops After Dark Job and Resource 
Fair - The city of Cleveland is making 
strides to support the youth through its 
innovative Hoops After Dark program. 
This initiative, aimed at engaging 
young men in positive activities, 
recently hosted a successful job and 
resource fair at the East Professional 
Center.  

3. Community Forestry Corps Kickoff 
with Sustainability - The Community 
Forestry Corps partnership officially 
kicked off in front of a large crowd at 
beautiful Luke Easter Park.  

4. Community Health Fair with 
Cleveland Fire - The Cleveland 
Division of Fire has taken a bold step in 
promoting the health and safety of our 

 
Click Here to Watch the Livestream 



youngest residents, they recently 
hosted a community health fair with a 
focus on preventing infant mortality.  

5. Karamu House Homecoming - The 
world-famous Karamu House 
welcomed members of the 
community into its halls for its 
homecoming celebration. 

6. Cleveland Fashion Gala - After five 
months of planning, Cleveland City 
Hall played host to the inaugural 
Cleveland Fashion Gala.  

7. Wade Oval Wednesdays - What 
began as a simple lunchtime escape 
from the office, Wade Oval 
Wednesdays has evolved into a 
summer-long celebration of 
Cleveland's vibrant arts and culture 
scene. 

6:30AM 
AGE FRIENDLY CLEVELAND:  GET 
CONNECTED WITH DIGITALC’S 
AFFORDABLE INTERNET 

Age Friendly Cleveland showcases 
programs and services for Cleveland 
Seniors. In this episode we talk with 
Joshua Edmonds, the CEO of DigitalC 
about the new affordable internet that 
is available for Cleveland residents 
and DigitalC’s other programs that 
help seniors “get connected”. 

7:00AM MAYOR’S TOWN HALL 

Mayor Justin Bibb held a Town Hall at 
Gunning Recreation Center on July 
17th.  Cleveland residents had the 
opportunity to ask questions and get 
answers from the mayor and his 
cabinet about what's happening in our 
city. 

8:00AM TV20 News See 6am 

8:30AM 
COMMUNITY FORESTRY CORPS 
KICK-OFF WITH SUSTAINABILITY 

Local leaders joined Mayor Justin M. 
Bibb, Councilwoman Deborah Gray, 



the USDA Under Secretary for Natural 
Resources and the Environment, Dr. 
Homer Wilkes, and national leaders 
from the Student Conservation 
Association (SCA) and the Center for 
Regenerative Solutions to kick off the 
Community Forestry Corps (CFC) 
Program in Cleveland, a multifaceted 
collaboration in urban forestry 
workforce development for youth. The 
event highlighted the program’s goals, 
including delivering equity-based 
benefits to underserved communities, 
addressing urban forestry challenges, 
and providing meaningful climate 
action work for youth. 

9:00AM 
STATE OF WARD 5 WITH 
COUNCILMAN RICHARD STARR 

Ward 5 Councilman Richard Starr lays 
out projects, goals, and a vision for his 
ward and his work on City Council.   

10:00AM TV20 News See 6am 

10:30AM CREATIVE FOCUS 

Highlighted Arts & Culture in The City 
of Cleveland, with Host Cornell 
Calhoun.  Today’s Guest: Erica Miller.  
Erica is a landscape painter and fiber 
artist who has been with The Tower 
Press Artist Group since 2012. Her 
paintings and weavings are in private 
collections and her current work 
focuses on using color, light and 
texture to create moody abstract 
images. 

11:00AM 
CUYAHOGA COUNTY PARTNERING 
AGENCIES RESOURCES AND 
PROGRAMS PRESS CONFERENCE 

Cuyahoga County Executive Chris 
Ronayne and other County and City 
leadership, representatives from our 
municipalities, and community 
organizations outlined summer 
programs and resources designed to 
support families and children.  This 



collaborative effort aims to ensure a 
safe and enjoyable summer for all. 

12:00PM TV20 NEWS See 6am 

12:30PM 
AGE FRIENDLY CLEVELAND:  GET 
CONNECTED WITH DIGITALC’S 
AFFORDABLE INTERNET 

Age Friendly Cleveland showcases 
programs and services for Cleveland 
Seniors. In this episode we talk with 
Joshua Edmonds, the CEO of DigitalC 
about the new affordable internet that 
is available for Cleveland residents 
and DigitalC’s other programs that 
help seniors “get connected”. 

1:00PM MAYOR’S TOWN HALL 

Mayor Justin Bibb held a Town Hall at 
Gunning Recreation Center on July 
17th.  Cleveland residents had the 
opportunity to ask questions and get 
answers from the mayor and his 
cabinet about what's happening in our 
city. 

2:00PM TV20 News See 6am 

2:30PM 
COMMUNITY FORESTRY CORPS 
KICK-OFF WITH SUSTAINABILITY 

Local leaders joined Mayor Justin M. 
Bibb, Councilwoman Deborah Gray, 
the USDA Under Secretary for Natural 
Resources and the Environment, Dr. 
Homer Wilkes, and national leaders 
from the Student Conservation 
Association (SCA) and the Center for 
Regenerative Solutions to kick off the 
Community Forestry Corps (CFC) 
Program in Cleveland, a multifaceted 
collaboration in urban forestry 
workforce development for youth. The 
event highlighted the program’s goals, 
including delivering equity-based 
benefits to underserved communities, 
addressing urban forestry challenges, 
and providing meaningful climate 
action work for youth. 

3:00PM 
STATE OF WARD 5 WITH 
COUNCILMAN RICHARD STARR 

Ward 5 Councilman Richard Starr lays 
out projects, goals, and a vision for his 
ward and his work on City Council.   



4:00PM TV20 News See 6am 

4:30PM CREATIVE FOCUS 

Highlighted Arts & Culture in The City 
of Cleveland, with Host Cornell 
Calhoun.  Today’s Guest: Erica Miller.  
Erica is a landscape painter and fiber 
artist who has been with The Tower 
Press Artist Group since 2012. Her 
paintings and weavings are in private 
collections and her current work 
focuses on using color, light and 
texture to create moody abstract 
images. 

5:00PM 
CUYAHOGA COUNTY PARTNERING 
AGENCIES RESOURCES AND 
PROGRAMS PRESS CONFERENCE 

Cuyahoga County Executive Chris 
Ronayne and other County and City 
leadership, representatives from our 
municipalities, and community 
organizations outlined summer 
programs and resources designed to 
support families and children.  This 
collaborative effort aims to ensure a 
safe and enjoyable summer for all. 

6:00PM TV20 NEWS See 6am 

6:30PM 
AGE FRIENDLY CLEVELAND:  GET 
CONNECTED WITH DIGITALC’S 
AFFORDABLE INTERNET 

Age Friendly Cleveland showcases 
programs and services for Cleveland 
Seniors. In this episode we talk with 
Joshua Edmonds, the CEO of DigitalC 
about the new affordable internet that 
is available for Cleveland residents 
and DigitalC’s other programs that 
help seniors “get connected”. 

7:00PM MAYOR’S TOWN HALL 

Mayor Justin Bibb held a Town Hall at 
Gunning Recreation Center on July 
17th.  Cleveland residents had the 
opportunity to ask questions and get 
answers from the mayor and his 
cabinet about what's happening in our 
city. 

8:00PM TV20 News See 6am 



8:30PM 
COMMUNITY FORESTRY CORPS 
KICK-OFF WITH SUSTAINABILITY 

Local leaders joined Mayor Justin M. 
Bibb, Councilwoman Deborah Gray, 
the USDA Under Secretary for Natural 
Resources and the Environment, Dr. 
Homer Wilkes, and national leaders 
from the Student Conservation 
Association (SCA) and the Center for 
Regenerative Solutions to kick off the 
Community Forestry Corps (CFC) 
Program in Cleveland, a multifaceted 
collaboration in urban forestry 
workforce development for youth. The 
event highlighted the program’s goals, 
including delivering equity-based 
benefits to underserved communities, 
addressing urban forestry challenges, 
and providing meaningful climate 
action work for youth. 

9:00PM 
STATE OF WARD 5 WITH 
COUNCILMAN RICHARD STARR 

Ward 5 Councilman Richard Starr lays 
out projects, goals, and a vision for his 
ward and his work on City Council.   

10:00PM TV20 News See 6am 

10:30PM CREATIVE FOCUS 

Highlighted Arts & Culture in The City 
of Cleveland, with Host Cornell 
Calhoun.  Today’s Guest: Erica Miller.  
Erica is a landscape painter and fiber 
artist who has been with The Tower 
Press Artist Group since 2012. Her 
paintings and weavings are in private 
collections and her current work 
focuses on using color, light and 
texture to create moody abstract 
images. 

11:00PM 
CUYAHOGA COUNTY PARTNERING 
AGENCIES RESOURCES AND 
PROGRAMS PRESS CONFERENCE 

Cuyahoga County Executive Chris 
Ronayne and other County and City 
leadership, representatives from our 
municipalities, and community 
organizations outlined summer 
programs and resources designed to 



support families and children.  This 
collaborative effort aims to ensure a 
safe and enjoyable summer for all. 

12:00AM TV20 News See 6am 

12:30AM 
AGE FRIENDLY CLEVELAND:  GET 
CONNECTED WITH DIGITALC’S 
AFFORDABLE INTERNET 

Age Friendly Cleveland showcases 
programs and services for Cleveland 
Seniors. In this episode we talk with 
Joshua Edmonds, the CEO of DigitalC 
about the new affordable internet that 
is available for Cleveland residents 
and DigitalC’s other programs that 
help seniors “get connected”. 

1:00AM MAYOR’S TOWN HALL 

Mayor Justin Bibb held a Town Hall at 
Gunning Recreation Center on July 
17th.  Cleveland residents had the 
opportunity to ask questions and get 
answers from the mayor and his 
cabinet about what's happening in our 
city. 

2:00AM TV20 News See 6am 

2:30AM 
COMMUNITY FORESTRY CORPS 
KICK-OFF WITH SUSTAINABILITY 

Local leaders joined Mayor Justin M. 
Bibb, Councilwoman Deborah Gray, 
the USDA Under Secretary for Natural 
Resources and the Environment, Dr. 
Homer Wilkes, and national leaders 
from the Student Conservation 
Association (SCA) and the Center for 
Regenerative Solutions to kick off the 
Community Forestry Corps (CFC) 
Program in Cleveland, a multifaceted 
collaboration in urban forestry 
workforce development for youth. The 
event highlighted the program’s goals, 
including delivering equity-based 
benefits to underserved communities, 
addressing urban forestry challenges, 
and providing meaningful climate 
action work for youth. 



3:00AM 
STATE OF WARD 5 WITH 
COUNCILMAN RICHARD STARR 

Ward 5 Councilman Richard Starr lays 
out projects, goals, and a vision for his 
ward and his work on City Council.   

4:00AM TV20 News See 6am 

4:30AM CREATIVE FOCUS 

Highlighted Arts & Culture in The City 
of Cleveland, with Host Cornell 
Calhoun.  Today’s Guest: Erica Miller.  
Erica is a landscape painter and fiber 
artist who has been with The Tower 
Press Artist Group since 2012. Her 
paintings and weavings are in private 
collections and her current work 
focuses on using color, light and 
texture to create moody abstract 
images. 

5:00AM 
CUYAHOGA COUNTY PARTNERING 
AGENCIES RESOURCES AND 
PROGRAMS PRESS CONFERENCE 

Cuyahoga County Executive Chris 
Ronayne and other County and City 
leadership, representatives from our 
municipalities, and community 
organizations outlined summer 
programs and resources designed to 
support families and children.  This 
collaborative effort aims to ensure a 
safe and enjoyable summer for all. 

 


